
 

School Year 8/2022-5/2023

ASC NORTH SOUTH Total Quantity

Bid Unit 

Price Bid Total

Bid Unit 

Price Bid Total

Bid Unit 

Price Bid Total

SIZE/COLOR  

WHITE 20LB 8 1/2 X 11 30 360 800 1190 $52.50 $62,475.00 $59.90 $71,281.00 $47.50 $56,525.00

11 X 17 0 0 2 2 $68.00 $136.00 $64.90 $129.80 $48.00 $96.00

8 1/2 X 14 0 0 2 2 $75.00 $150.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 $116.00

For Mosaic 8 1/2 x 14 - Astroparche 60 lbs 0 1 0 1 No Bid No Bid $89.90 $89.90 No Bid No Bid

Aged 0 0 0 0  

COLORED PAPER 20LB 81/2 X 11  

BLUE 0 0 0 0    

BUFF 0 0 0 0

CANARY 0 0 10 10 $68.00 $680.00 $69.90 $699.00 $55.00 $550.00

CHERRY 0 0 0 0

CREAM 0 0 0 0

GOLDENROD 0 0 0 0

GRAY 0 0 0 0

GREEN 0 0 10 10 $68.00 $680.00 $69.90 $699.00 $55.00 $550.00

ORCHID 0 0 0 0  

PINK 0 0 5 5 $68.00 $340.00 $69.90 $349.50 $55.00 $275.00

SALMON 0 0 0 0  

TAN 0 0 10 10 $68.00 $680.00 $69.90 $699.00 $55.00 $550.00

COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11   

ASTROPARCHE BLUE 0 0 0 0

ASTROPARCHE NATURAL 0 0 0 0

OPAQUE CREAM 0 0 0 0

ASTROPARCHE WHITE 0 0 0 0

COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11  

BRIGHT GREEN 0 4 0 4 $125.00 $500.00 $99.90 $399.60 $121.00 $484.00

FIREBALL FUSCIA 0 3 0 3 $125.00 $375.00 $99.90 $299.70 $121.00 $363.00

0 0 0 0    

COLORED PAPER 90LB 81/2 X 11   

BLUE 0 0 0 0

BUFF 0 0 0 0

CANARY 0 0 0 0

CHERRY 0 0 0 0

CREAM 0 0 0 0

GREEN 0 0 0 0

GOLDENROD 0 0 0 0

ORCHID 0 0 0 0

PINK 0 0 0 0

SALMON 0 0 0 0

TAN 0 0 0 0

WHITE BRITE 0 0 0 0   

30 368 839 1237    

Impact Networking Garvey Office Products Contract Paper Group

COMMUNITY H.S. DIST 99 RECYCLED PAPER

By Location


