|COMMUNITY H.S. DIST 99

LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BID

|Schoo| Year

| 8/2023-5/2024

RECYCLED PAPER

By Location Midland Contract Paper Group Paper 101 Garvey Murnane
ASC NORTH SOUTH Total Quantity Bid Unit Price Bid Total Bid Unit Price Bid Total Bid Unit Price Bid Total Bid Unit Price Bid Total Bid Unit Price Bid Total
SIZE/COLOR
WHITE 20LB 812X 11 30 850 1100 1980 $40.60 $80,388.00 $37.05 $73,359.00 $39.95 $79,101.00 $42.25 $83,655.00 $41.60 $82,368.00
NATURAL CHOICE UNACCEPTABLE 11X 17 3 0 3 $43.90 $131.70 $42.50 $127.50 $44.07 $132.21 $48.94 $146.82 $45.00 $135.00
81/2X 14 0 0 0
For Mosaic 8 1/2 x 14 - Astroparche 60 Ibs 2 0 2 $225.00 $450.00 NO BID $141.21 $282.42 $46.50 $93.00 $125.00 $250.00
Aged 0 0
COLORED PAPER 20LB 81/2 X 11 0
BLUE 22 0 22 $49.20 $1,082.40 $50.50 $1,111.00 $49.77 $1,094.94 $54.20 $1,192.40 $49.00 $1,078.00
BUFF 0 13 $49.20 $639.60 $50.50 $656.50 $49.77 $647.01 $250.89 $3,261.57 $49.00 $637.00
CANARY 0 25 $49.20 $1,230.00 $50.50 $1,262.50 $49.77 $1,244.25 $93.50 $2,337.50 $49.00 $1,225.00
CHERRY 0 0
CREAM 0 0
GOLDENROD 0 18 $49.20 $885.60 $50.50 $909.00 $49.77 $895.86 $93.50 $1,683.00 $49.00 $882.00
GRAY 0 0
GREEN 0 21 $49.20 $1,033.20 $50.50 $1,060.50 $49.77 $1,045.17 $93.50 $1,963.50 $49.00 $1,029.00
ORCHID 0 23 $49.20 $97.50 (Terra Green) $50.50 $1,161.50 $49.77 $1,144.71 $93.50 $2,150.50 $49.00 $1,127.00
PINK 0 12 $49.20 $590.40 $50.50 $606.00 $49.77 $597.24 $93.50 $1,122.00 $49.00 $588.00
SALMON 0 15 $49.20 $738.00 $50.50 $757.50 $49.77 $746.55 $88.10 $1,321.50 $49.00 $735.00
TAN 0 0
COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11 0
ASTROPARCHE BLUE 0 0 0
ASTROPARCHE NATURAL 0 0 0
OPAQUE CREAM 0 0 0
ASTROPARCHE WHITE 0 0 0
COLORED PAPER 60LB 81/2 X 11 0
BRIGHT GREEN 6 - 6 $108.00 $648.00 $97.50 (Terra Green) $585.00 $99.83 $598.98 $169.70 $1,018.20 $104.00 $624.00
FIREBALL FUSCIA 6 6 $108.00 $648.00 $97.50 $585.00 $99.83 $598.98 $105.90 $635.40 $104.00 $624.00
0
COLORED PAPER 90LB 81/2 X 11 0
BLUE 4 $53.40 $213.60 $57.10 $228.40 $66.70 $266.80 $9.86 $39.44 $59.00 $236.00
BUFF 7 $53.40 $373.80 NO BID $66.70 $466.90 $143.20 $1,002.40 $59.00 $413.00
CANARY 7 $53.40 $373.80 $57.10 $399.70 $66.70 $466.90 $74.08 $518.56 $59.00 $413.00
CHERRY 0 discontinued
CREAM 0
GREEN 7 $53.40 $373.80 $57.10 $399.70 $66.70 $466.90 $264.24 $1,849.68 $59.00 $413.00
GOLDENROD 10 $47.40 $474.00 NO BID $66.70 $667.00 $76.80 $768.00 $59.00 $590.00
ORCHID 4 discontinued NO BID $66.70 $266.80 $249.60 $998.40 $59.00 $236.00
PINK 7 $47.40 $331.80 $57.10 $399.70 $66.70 $466.90 $77.68 $543.76 $59.00 $413.00
SALMON 2 $53.40 $106.80 NO BID $66.70 $133.40 $101.60 $203.20 $59.00 $118.00
WHITE BRITE 4 $51.50 $206.00 $57.80 $228.40 $64.58 $258.32 $78.40 $313.60 $57.00 $228.00
30 1068 1,100 2,198 $90,918.50 $83,836.90 $91,589.24 $106,817.43 $94,362.00




