

COMMUNITY H.S. DIST 99		RECYCLED PAPER											
School Year	8/2021-5/2022	By Location			Contract Paper Group		LOWEST ACCEPTABLE BID		Paper 101		Veritiv		
	SIZE/COLOR	ASC	NORTH	SOUTH	Total Quantity	Bid Unit Price	Bid Total	Bid Unit Price	Bid Total	Bid Unit Price	Bid Total	Bid Unit Price	Bid Total
WHITE 20LB	8 1/2 X 11	25	460	80	565	\$31.35	\$17,712.75	\$30.48	\$17,221.20	\$34.50	\$19,492.50	\$49.92	\$28,204.80
	11 X 17	0	2	0	2	\$31.00	\$62.00	\$29.95	\$59.90	\$40.00	\$80.00	\$53.78	\$107.56
	8 1/2 X 14	0	2	0	2	\$39.80	\$79.60	\$38.20	\$76.40	\$50.88	\$101.76	\$68.44	\$136.88
COLORED PAPER 20LB 8 1/2 X 11													
	BLUE	0	3	0	3	\$40.30		\$40.80	\$122.40	\$40.78	\$122.34	\$54.94	\$164.82
	BUFF	0	4	0	4	\$40.30		\$40.80	\$163.20	\$40.78	\$163.12	\$54.94	\$219.76
	CANARY	0	5	0	5	\$40.30	\$201.50	\$40.80	\$204.00	\$40.78	\$203.90	\$54.94	\$274.70
	CHERRY	0	2	0	2	\$40.30	\$80.60	\$40.80	\$81.60	\$40.78	\$81.56	\$54.94	\$109.88
	CREAM	0	6	0	6	\$40.30	\$241.80	\$40.80	\$244.80	\$40.78	\$244.68	\$54.94	\$329.64
	GOLDENROD	0	1	0	1	\$40.30	\$40.30	\$40.80	\$40.80	\$40.78	\$40.78	\$54.94	\$54.94
	GRAY	0	4	0	4	\$40.30	\$161.20	\$40.80	\$163.20	\$40.78	\$163.12	\$54.94	\$219.76
	GREEN	0	4	0	4	\$40.30	\$161.20	\$40.80	\$163.20	\$40.78	\$163.12	\$54.94	\$219.76
	ORCHID	0	0	0	0								
	PINK	0	4	0	4	\$40.30	\$161.20	\$40.80	\$163.20	\$40.78	\$163.12	\$54.94	\$219.76
	SALMON	0	3	0	3	\$40.30		\$40.80	\$122.40	\$40.78	\$122.34	\$54.94	\$164.82
	TAN	0	4	0	4	\$40.30	\$161.20	\$40.80	\$163.20	\$40.78	\$163.12	\$54.94	\$219.76
	TWILIGHT TEAL	0	1	0	1	\$59.97	\$59.97	\$74.80	\$74.80	\$74.90	\$74.90		
COLORED PAPER 60LB 8 1/2 X 11													
	ASTROPARCHE BLUE	0		0	0								
	ASTROPARCHE NATURAL	0		0	0								
	OPAQUE CREAM	0		0	0								
	ASTROPARCHE WHITE	0		0	0								
COLORED PAPER 60LB 8 1/2 X 11													
	COSMIC ORANGE	0	1	0	1	\$70.95	\$70.95	\$74.80	\$74.80	\$89.90	\$89.90	No Bid*	No Bid*
	BEAMING BLUE	0	0	0	0								
	BRIGHT GREEN	0	1	0	1	\$70.95	\$70.95	\$74.80	\$74.80	\$89.90	\$89.90	No Bid*	No Bid*
	FIREBALL FUSCIA	0	1	0	1	\$70.95	\$70.95	\$74.80	\$74.80	\$89.90	\$89.90	No Bid*	No Bid*
	ROCKET RED	0		0	0								
	SUNBURST YELLOW	0	2	0	2	\$70.95	\$141.90	\$74.80	\$149.60	\$89.90	\$179.80	No Bid*	No Bid*
		0											
COLORED PAPER 90LB 8 1/2 X 11													
	BLUE	0	5	0	5	\$44.69	\$223.45	\$41.50	\$207.50	\$44.14	\$220.70	\$59.22	\$296.10
	BUFF	0	5	0	5	\$44.69	\$223.45	\$41.50	\$207.50	\$44.14	\$220.70	\$59.22	\$296.10
	CANARY	0	5	0	5	\$44.69	\$223.45	\$41.50	\$207.50	\$44.14	\$220.70	\$59.22	\$296.10
	CHERRY	0	3	0	3	\$44.69	\$134.07	\$41.50	\$124.50	\$44.14	\$132.42	\$59.22	\$177.66
	CREAM	0	0	0	0								
	GREEN	0	6	0	6	\$44.69	\$268.14	\$41.50	\$249.00	\$44.14	\$264.84	\$59.22	\$355.32
	GOLDENROD	0	4	0	4	\$40.75	\$163.00	\$36.60	\$146.40	\$44.14	\$176.56	\$49.22	\$196.88
	ORCHID	0	6	0	6	\$40.75	\$244.50	\$36.60	\$219.60	\$44.14	\$264.84	\$49.22	\$295.32
	PINK	0	6	0	6	\$40.75	\$244.50	\$36.60	\$219.60	\$44.14	\$264.84	\$49.22	\$295.32
	SALMON	0	7	0	7	\$44.69	\$312.83	\$41.50	\$290.50	\$44.14	\$308.98	\$59.22	\$414.54
	TAN	0	3	0	3	\$40.75	\$122.25	\$36.60	\$109.80	\$44.14	\$132.42	\$49.22	\$147.66
	WHITE BRITE	0	6	0	6	\$42.10	\$252.60	\$39.60	\$237.60	\$42.40	\$254.40	\$59.22	\$355.32
		25	566	80	671		\$21,890.31		\$21,657.80		\$24,291.26		\$33,773.16